
HIGHLIGHTS 
 
           
              As the ages rolled by men became concerned about the accuracy of time and its 
beginning, therefore some men turned their attention to the research of time and different 
epoxies were chosen, by which to establish the beginning of time.  It was determined that 
there was a four year discrepancy in the B.C. period, by a Catholic monk.  Not wanting to 
disturb the then present time method of counting, the monk decided to add the four years 
to the beginning of creation.  Thus you will find the year 4004 B.C. at the top of the 
center reference of the Bible.  This of course is wrong according to Biblical prophesy and 
astronomical law.   
              My research led me to realize that there was a loss of four years at the time of 
Christ’s birth, and that this time needed to be dealt with. In doing so it was shown that 
there was only 4000 years from creation to the birth of Christ, instead of the 4004 as 
claimed. The four years unaccounted for involved Christ’s need to escape the death 
decree that King Herod made to destroy all male children to the age of two years old, 
hoping  to destroy the Father’s son --(Yahshua).  This effort was prevented by the Father-
(YHWH), for he send a message to Joseph by an angel in a dream, saying to take the 
young child and his mother and flee into Egypt until the death of King Herod.  By doing 
this Christ was lost sight of, and his identity forgotten during the years they were in 
Egypt and in Nazareth. At the time that Christ’s identity was finally made known, it was 
determined that Yahshua was born four years before they started counting time in A.D.    
But the calendar was never updated to reflect the lost four years.  This is why I updated 
Creation Calendar to show the lost four years in adding them in the year 2000, which put 
the calendar in harmony with the law of nature, called astronomical law.  You will see 
this as you look at the calendar today that you hold in your hands.   

 

  EVERY 28 YEARS  
             
                Every 28 years, Creation Calendar comes back in balance with God’s creation 
time. In the week of creation,  the moon and sun were created on the same day (fourth 
day) so the beginning of the month and year were on the same day, meaning, (lunar year 
and solar year and the vernal equinox fall on the same day). Vernal Equinox is when day 
and night are equal and the number of days in a year were always 360. But after the 
flood, the solar year became 365 1/4 days long and the lunar year 354 days long. So 
every 28 years, these two events ( new moon and new year, vernal equinox) fall on the 
same day, as it was in the week of creation. This year this event will take place on March 
16, 2010 Gregorian time, and  Abib 1 YHWH’s time. 
 

March 16, 2010 starts the 28 year cycle and the new Creation Calendar Year.  




